
8-14 Dalkeith Crescent OCEAN GROVE VIC

If you're after a delicious meal but don't want the bother of
cooking it yourself, you go to a restaurant renowned for fine
dining and order exactly what you want straight off the
menu. Likewise, if you want a fresh, contemporary home,
without the fuss of designing and arranging a build yourself,
you can take advantage of the quality and beautiful design
of this brand new home. Here is your chance to achieve
significant savings in stamp duty on your very own home in
the heart of one of the Bellarine's most coveted locations,
Ocean Grove.

The modern multi-fronted facade of this solid brick home,
with an elegant angled roofline will greet you as you wind
your way along Dalkeith Crescent. Single storey and
comprising three bedrooms, plus study and two generous
living spaces, it will be ideal for permanent or holiday living.
The kitchen is at the heart of the home with glamorous
glass splash-backs, stainless steel appliances and a wide
stone breakfast bar overlooking the adjacent living space.
You can imagine this will be the busy family hub with plenty
of room for kid's toys, a large communal dining table and
sunny, summer BBQs spilling out onto the alfresco dining
area in the rear garden.
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Price : $ 452,500
View : https://www.bellarineproperty.com.au/1503197
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